
Grapes:
Trebbiano Toscano and Malvasia Bianca; Southwest exposition; the
younger vineyard is Guyot training, with the older vineyard is
cordon spur; 3000-5000 plants per hectare, with the soil based with
calcareous clay and filled with fossils from the Plio-Pleistocene area. 

Harvest:
the grapes are harvested by hand in the last week of September. They
are brought immediately into the winery in small baskets to preserve
the integrity of the grapes. 

Vinification:
this particular wine is the result of a long period of research and
multiple tests to figure out how to best express the grapes’
characteristics. Daphné spends 5-10 days macerating on the skins,
depending on the vintage, in open containers and ambient
temperature with manual punching down of the cap occurring daily.
This is to ensure the extraction of aromas, tannins and phenols. After
the maceration, the fermentation takes place in Barriques and
Tonneaux barrels without the addition of selected yeasts or chemical
agents. It then matures in oak for 10-12 months, bottled without
filtration or clarification which maintains its characteristics.

Sensory Characteristics
A golden color, Daphné is a complex wine with a strong structure
similar to that of a red wine. Floral on the nose thanks to Malvasia
Bianca, it also has an expressive minerality with herbal notes thanks
to the Trebbiano. It finishes with pleasant fruit and a long
persistence. 

Pairings:
The structure of the wine allows Daphné to be paired with dishes
typically  matched with red wines: meats, aged cheeses and, most of
all, it best expresses its complexity with White Truffle from San
Miniato. Exciting  with spicy curries native to Indian tradition.

Serving temperature:
12-17 degrees - open 20 minutes before to experience the true depth
of aromas and flavors. 
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